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 Social networks need the mediation of objects, the shared agency of people and 
objects, as quasi-objects (Latour, 1993) or posthuman forms of entangled agency 
(Hayles, 1999) in order to provide time and space extension to people’s interactions. 
Objects, such as the mobile phone, are shaping the material conditions of our existence, 
contributing to an emergent mobile culture (Urry, 2000; Goggin, 2006). This paper will 
analyse the transformations of subjectivities related to the uses and ownership of mobile 
phones linked to different types of convergence: convergence of different applications 
such as voice, text, data, images and music; and also the convergence of different 
interactions and social functions afforded by the device, such as connectivity, coordina-
tion, everyday organisation, control and monitoring, affective communication and 
emotion management, accessibility, heteronomy and autonomy, or privacy and trans-
parency. The meeting of such diverse features in the same artefact reveals tensions and 
conflicts which are somehow hided by the term of ‘convergence’. Drawing on recent 
research carried out in Madrid about mobile uses and couple relationships, and on my 
former cross-cultural research about mobile phone uses and users in Madrid, London 
and Paris (Lasen, 2005), the paper will relate the account of some mobile phones con-
tributions to the shaping of contemporary subjectivities with the concept of ‘Dionysian 
materialism’, coined by Peter Sloterdijk (1989) from his reading of Nietzsche. This no-
tion of materialism, as an ecstatic and Dionysian learning, links the attention to the 
material conditions of our existence to the realm of passions, embodiment and affects. 
This can be explored through the study of associations between people and technology, 
for instance through the complex relationships of these devices with affects and 
emotions (from the creation of opportunities for the sharing and expression of emotions, 
or the affective link to the object itself, to its role in disciplining bodies and managing 
emotions), or the subtle combination of activity and passivity in the way people use and 
learn to use the devices 
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